eSO eldT aw:szs

a’aéécséc MIATN A

2.05333¢ WPReIT
(S00DHITT YT eSR)

FTooréd¥ B®Fo0 JoFnY (3WH)_RBD) oD, 2021
(20213 QERERFH DFech? osd—22)

TOOFE)T AT/TB ROFPNY LPDAONED, 1959, IR, 3R WRWEN 20T
QIGRODT. :

Q). YR, BNOT FOT) WAEI NWLINPMN, FVoEET IDBTOT IOPNY IO,
19593); (1959 O Toordds DI RODBs 11 D3R, SRR &50mIHTD
ONFeRNTRHTO0OT.

YT, 25003 LT DT, 0B SFREGE), TIVEET Toss LIPS eNOBODOT T
FODT0I3 PO eNIeN:-

1. Bo3R, JVRD DB, FYV0Y.- T LIPJIDRNTI), FOE&dT RBTC ROoPNRY
(ST BB) e9DIAHED, 2021 DOTH TEAHI T,

(AT, &1 BRTCK 20N WOIT,N,.

2. 283¢ RTORW 3TH VD .-TTEET IWTT ROPNRY  PIADD, 19598 (19593
FOIFET eIDI0ND "0835:11) (VWBES), Y, V0T TR LIRIONEEOT eve3 LDRETDNG)
23 yTORTE), (B-1-0) DOTT, WEETDN B2 s0DITWN,, T8 RCBIITR,, DOTWT:-

“(@-1-) "BEID" H0W3, DT XPONES), NS DB, NIFERONRIE
9DTIVTBRODNR 93T ABBTT ROPNFE), €3 AWTT ROTW, BEIDNALN eDI), €33 TSI
NOTD OYTIF, eNTINTWIAL €3 ABTOT ROPE DIORIHBONG), I DERISN) 9T
290 RLDFEN 95330 L302IDFEN FNOBPLANOT e TeTol3 ATBTIT ROFTS ITXEIT."

3.63¢R, 30T STWIFD.- 3RS IRICNTNT 6:3¢ STyTTLAT ()3 SVT-IyTTEDTIC), -

G) (29) BDOBT WEON B BWVODTER, TWIBORLBRIT,LI, DOT3:-

“(2J) D3y, eIREOTT) 5B NYINTR), IRFWITT ROB;0d B[R, 38,03 TR
BTIT,TL). eI, €922 0T 2,0TE TEDOWT, ARDTV3IT, .0, &3)."

(i) (22) VORI 3TV 8% 2OITI, AADAIT,L,, DOTWT:-

"(23-1) DE3Q), HVETOTT) ATTOTC AOPNRYINGT,L), €923¢ T30 R083;030 BREWRT,03
T RU3T,TL)

WO0B) Tty ATOETed )R IyTOLRYE) 9XBFTI0 ABTT ROPNY HOB5030
BRTNRTB,03 TREDONT TR 933, 930D 38R0,

4. 173¢ B30T ATH_FB.- DR SIPIAANTNT 17:3¢ ByTTEW),,-
(i) (1) ByTTT "F*" VORE TR & 2DI0DTTN, 33 eCBRI TN, DOWT:-

"(F) BOPT P00 €IIT, DBLITOA WHBNAET 2I0;0D eI 0 2WBRL €930
930 FOANT, FOFROT BOWE WL SOTWBLNCIPNG T."

(ii) (2d) GOTTYTTEITI WTOT B eDIODITW), T3 ABBLRRIT,T),, DOTT:-



"(2-2d) OBRTC 2353030 2.0TE N0 &35e38000 SBAISTIE BB 95w B23,S ABTT
ROPNPS), ITA;TONTITIHT 95e00 BWA0ON eOTTON 3T FOWIWOTE) , FIEEIT
ADTC AOPNY (3TIR) PO, 2021 T 00T DIOTR0T 30W3I), AINY
930D 2,.FMN 33T e30,00 OPYTC 2,00 FOPWE), AWR3, NPLATAEHTD 33N
0T N03TLED,. TN B 333D IPOVITWST, €33 BRALIWN OIS ABTC I0IT,
FOTITSRC 9630 FEF33,53) D03 BALTTITBOR) 2I0eIRIF,T,."

5. 2083¢ R, TORE STH_JWR.- s LIRS 20:3¢ TWFTLATI (2) NVBTyTTLTES), -

(i) (eiil) VOB WB0ITE TN, B8 &DODTTR, &)803,eC8RIT,T0,,
OTIT:-

“BB0B) B DOBETIHTD OIVeHTR LT RBALOTEIZIVNGE DFE IBITCH BTBORIES
0T ROPT RRT eNTRRLIONE), 3NI), ROPE BSBWPI :DORBPOD BRTW WDTTTBCNE),
20330 AT AWR5IN 93 ,0NNIT, T,

(ii) (d-iv) DOBT WWBANR S8 TNODIT, T)303eEBEIT,LD,, NOWT:-

"(e-iv) €331 O3NTEN 3PTRVET THTI 0TI WOAET aNTO APNY &yd TR, OIT0IHTC

QTR WORAET DT AN TOXTIN) ITOTIE 2,2, AWA5 W2, [p8ID LTI 2,20,
AO3ReN."

(i) BTOBTRII, BRTIITRA (d-V) DOTWE 22TWON, B2 0DITI,
B)3BRBAIT,T,, DOTT:-

(@-V) 0TI DX ADBTI0 BRENY 538 BRI AT RABTOT  3RET,N
NTVIRNFE), ADE R FBRRWBIIVEOT TR, ALRNFI, T ARPOZNEI, WFATAE,LN
LdFOTOE 2,2, AR LITIEI 2,2, TS IR.”

(iv) (R-V) DOBE IRADA) S BTOZDTHEE), “eNRTI VRENY” DO BWNLR "2,0TD BIET”
N0 BRINYI, T30S RERRIIT,LN.,.

V) D) POBTBAS dITHBONCE), “BAZHE DINPR” 2DI), ‘eI, DINYR" 02

BTN 2WOR "93,3.0003) DINLR” D3, "V 3 4730 AINPR” D02 BWNFN, DTN
AREIOWOI I E A AN

6. 22:3¢ BPR FTOHW BCIFW.- DR LINIODNT 213 JFTos 3300, S
FIODTBI, ADORITLL,, DOTT:-
“22. AeAHNYD), BRODDIFZPWBT S dwrordneh:- A3RHT ATFTD 0TI,

RFIFTROLS OPoBC AT RS 9T Ty AT OB R3E a0 T3 WL )T B30
ABTI0 R0Y, Tosy SUNYLD INeD I TORFET MNId R 00T aD3), BOWONI Toey
9D, 19933 (19930 TooredT e9DD0ND F0Bs 14) R 0ODE), B3R 28€39), TOIFTVONS
90 0T TIRSTWE, G0 IATWESAE DOWY, Teddd TR INRDD)
QODNFWIBITIVEOZ FOTT 2,630, REBd WOBTFRE), FFE 20BTR S, IETEWOT 23018,03
323, RO, BROTIFLL)."

7. 276 RE0T 3G BB~ 5RO DI 273 BT -

(i) () DOBTA, "eDRTY” 0L BWE TN “DTTY" 02 BWLIaI0,,
S 33eCBARIT,,;

(i) (X)) HOBRL), “OTWIPRFE)" DO IWE BRTON “FTFS 0T ABTID  SRENYE).
O50HTH DTRY AFDTOO BWRENPTON’ DOW JWRPSY, AORIT,T,, N3,



(i) BTOITWE), “2DRT WRENF" DO BDWNF VTR “2.0TD WRE'T DO
BOAF I, 3303 BRIT,3),.

8. 28:3¢ RT0HTW STH JR.- TR HPNRIACHINE 283K TyTOE ()X e BTTETI
383)a3003 81 EODITI, ADRIT,L,, DOWT:-

“3) IFB DTORZMN  FTRCTO, 273X J[FTORE @) I 0B-JTIne,
DR BBATOINNE VB3F,T,."

9. 29 A W50’ 3THFB.- 2DR® LRI 292 TFTLIT), -

) (NI NTTTOHRT () POBRWE), “BBVTOT FOFT,” 0 JIWINY IV "9
AOTOEE ABTOONR” D02 BENFN, AORIT,L,;

(i) B)I NTTTTHLT (B) VOWRE), "ISBERRAPAIVDIE” D0 JBT  2BOR
"3RTTITLIBII eDI), LITTBENRR PILIIN” DOW BRI, 3 303RLRRIT,,.

10. 299 FF0HT AW BBB,- 2RO WRICHENT 2978 TJTTTC), AT JITVOIHTT3
30020, B eNORT BWB0BHTR, RORAIT,T,, D0TIT:-

DI, [TBOID &HOBPOD O3B DT, Ae,NST9,N DT0SH SBOINBTR, TS, @23eondes
3039,0T AT, ROWODAWO3I, 9T [NFE ITROVIMNY &y DoeDITXEIIT  sDeoOT
DDOBL D T039,DT A,y B e350RBLTBITD.”

11. 39 O JF0TW A JD.- DR® PRIV 39 D TyTOLE, ()¢ evR-
TyTTeB), “wDIWe0 BEINFI," D02 JTRY BIR  “PIWTT JENF,” Q0w
BERP, 303602 R3T,T,.

12. 393 §30090 SBIBD.- DR 9RO 3980 JyTOIE),, -

) DI NT-TyTTTC), "B WyBToeY) 93,0003 353 NFOTTT”
D02 BENAY 3TV00N “DVORTHO  LIDTIONL” D0 BTWRYIN,
ARORIT,L,; D3I,
(i) "B e3ACRT® N eHIY." D02 BWNY 3B
"TDIT0TVT @WE3,0D, AW BRAIITTO,N €T “ 02 BTN,
AORIT,ED,.
13. 68x33¢ WTO0@ ISDHFJR.- DR HIOHIDT 68 &BIearse), (1)K
VBT TR~

(i) “"DEIEDRTIT” 0 VTWE BN “ ATHEDRIT, L), 0L B3I,
TS RERRIB,,; a3,
(i) “"STRDTONTT,” D02 TWE 3B “633¢ FTTEE BN I 3T,
BOBRLEFT0 WODORE), e9BeT” 02 BWNRP, ALDRIT,,.
14. 72 3¢ FF0OT 3TH_FR.- DR LPIORNTDT 723 &yTT3 (5 NTTyTOITI
3320, &% LI0DITN, AR 3T, DOTIT:-

6) B (1), (2) DI, (5) X NBITTLNY HRBONE), IDBTT IO
FSRBINR PRI ByHODON DBF,,U° €9:30) AIREIT ART DI0THOT &HRV) SRENY
9230 BRYR STOINRRP,ITLN,:

VB03) DNIFEE). eVDRITE ToTenPMmN 028X, 00, AWD 9RO, 204N
BRI 2DI3R0TH 9T IFDRTITI:



203, BT0I) Taz; ATeETEY), DVAL,T) [BRBET [VDOD L3, JRTHBMN Jyes
TIOLN Pe30DOTN eHINOWT, LD FRLTITI TTENLTON e953DONTY, IR DRI L9DTTEI,,
BRODTITW,."

15. 128 & RFOPTW ZCHFAB.- DR ORNICHTNEI 128 FTFTTW ITI0dH, oh
EODTITI, DR BB, OTIT:-

“128-00 XN oWW TWR.- (1) & L9DIHIDTY), TCRONE), TR
QORI 93230 N@WIPNFE), DI 2w FRROBRTINR; ABTIT WFRBPYAD 20303, Q0T
D23A,,0°Ce30) ATETDOTI RLAICODNTIIN BEITOR) 3T RBANI TV 95350 Ty €930
FOTW) ATIFTT ROl AToFD O3t 95330 235e3000e3x3),; SBANS TS 953550 T30
TI5e0eNRS (BWTE), B, WN0W FoBRtHS TRE F0FBOTD eue3 LD TING) DYTTeDT
FHA BIST ABTD FAOPWAS IPTTT AW 20BE  SEFIRN 95335300 NESCHOTH
TORBRATC), €33 03B B[RET ABBD ROFNRYH FOO3RERIeTNTEE BeXy, FCOW) ABTID
L5087 3300T  IDEFR BDBRAWTICREOT ABTD IOPNY  &NYDs  FToONEDRTEDBBN
FOLODATO3 IeHTY, FMREHRHW NI), IRTENE DTV, FIDONRIE TN ITO
NTLBTI, FBCORIYTT,N €9e3F5e3 DA WTICIVEOT I CNNTI, TR 9DTTDI,
DT3NP PIIDBIT. 905 FOANT, FBTOD 230503 De8AR, T Ce3D0T o7t 95T, IRAPAT.L).,
F03e023 AFBTT FOPNF) IR LIVITHIRWBITTR.T &3, BRTIHTBA 903D
TRENY 220, 0DNLRODT 235:3BORIT DTV, BRODTIB,T3L)..

(2) DBRY, BB, R, TCOLY ABTIO W0 0T VB LITo,N ZDAEW oonwe
ZORVBITE 2323,T0,N Tj3lTRE 03B BRI, 303NN NBIT03 BOBRLRI Ty
RDTID TS ROPRAYTR ONI;@WBAE  9IDTCRI), VRODTIF,TN,. DR AR, T V0T
ADE R BRRWTICE 90T DRTICT, 2033, B3V0T INDTBAT 930D 2PN ATO
BVRIBBN, T3 rBeN CHIPYRE ABTOD ROF POV, DB, TC[T) DR TITT
923803 53 90T BRI, TRIRT03 BO03eLRI ABTT ROPT, L3I RTBIC) eNI,
7130 BTTW OROHE), 03D LSNET BERRE Tt T33P0 9078 3T, IBTD
AOTT LITIT, 2R ORRPAIT,E,.”

16. 3BT0 2HTo3 ™o TOPTOOL FTRPOD 33 CER.- cDRE eIDIORNNEE),
"RABTIT DTITW O3RN Q02 WWNRTY WA FBNRFS L), “RBTOT DTV DYPNTT”
D02 BWRFR, T3 RERRIT,T),.



B £3ne) HIB), Todeny B3O

TooEEIT ADBTOT ROPNY IR, 195930, (19598 TEEIT ePICND RO 11) 68
TODR TITNRLMN eH IR, T 30RITHED 95335330030 SONEBR DN, -

() 17(2ed) TTTED, 20(2)(d-v) TWyTTED a0IY, 27 TTTLIT TTOIVTRE), DI WOSTI
BN DI, AWR$3, T, FOWORAT TRLGITIES T CUTWOFNP RN, 2IE30,0TBe;

() 20(2)(ed-1v) 20, (D-V) TyTTLOWI), Ty 33035 TOOEEITT SV TSIV OONT3
2303 BRBRT DEF* 98 NFE). [d,ReT ITIOTNF Y, BOBORIEN;

(R) RDE ATBAT APRLE), 23N, WNI), IBTOT ROPTW FOR, AINT,
WFRITRLL) NI), ABTIC AOFNY 35:3A0,BI0NE), AWRT AJHOD 230Ne30RIITONEC),
BV)20R233 T3 2 3T0NETI), 20, BXPOY;

(@) ANDBRAT 9RTPHADE), IBTT 2300/ IOPNY ReJwT00  a3yODC,
TREIENRR PR 20T 3TI DARIE2IR50TVOLS eIV AOBNY IR SNRLIOD;

-8, R,B0D), BN T 33, DP0e0e00t 3TN RBNF N, IB 00BN,
€33 D0TS B8 LITHCDT.




SDFT WO VS RI)

TF0e)3 ToRTBT Behed OISt BedS 5323,53:0, L PRBOBTIEHDE),.



% 39,03.00233 DO B30 T0E $)OS %o, B I3,

NOW 6: | AW BRODTE RB) WORIRFE 239Ny ROFE 2,830, &
WORBRFE HFWe 0OWORND, NCBOIZ QODRINFI, T¥ReN
Todss ATOE T, e9DTT330, LTI T3.

FER0e)3 TRATOIT Fade)) 2elTOD A RTINS

DEF L3, BreshIeot
RBFC O,

20.3. NTVRY
FONFTEE ()
TIOFLIT TS I



edhwog’

Booréld IBFo0 FoFNY eaDAohed, 19598 (19590 FToF &) e9DIoHD Joal;. 11)
el\)doog mﬂ

XX XX XX
2. F0IRBVRM.- T8 9D IRDRDTD, RO VR0 NI ;RBAT BRTID,-
XX XX XX

(9-1-) "FEIY' HOW3B, ¥3T RABVTD AOPNYE), €3 ABTD ROFRT, TyS3IPRIS
FDOBPANOT KeDR, L3, RBTOD ROFPT eDOWPOD 2020, RT3

XX XX XX

6. R@BTo0 FoNY BCoTBrvN e928F .- (1) 03I03POR) AFBTT FOFTW SELOTIEBMON
DODeNRLBICIVBEOR SeRRAICANC), DI, 90T dB IPOSNTR, DT 3Te00d DBAY,, IR
920N, I AI,E; B, WRE T BOFPT IRADTE), 93 NZ;RBRRWTBICOOT D,
393 30DR, WENRIDH,.

(2) €905 B3 O3ROTI 923603, B8 NORT eaNINPR 9MHEDTIIN BT IT,TN, O3
() 292850 BRIONE), RFTBTOT ROPT 3m0,e)3 VT ODNY 603 B3NP, ©ONGRIT,TN;
() D), LIZBE IV 353, NYNTIIE),, e93F o33 A03;0300 B3 8,03 T WTI™,Te);

(%) €923 3003E), 303,020,350 BAOS0ED BRENRAPR ¢ 3, TODAS s8.03N3 3T, 0.
TNIB), LIRF TV T3 TéIO2) We3TaNT 3T, ;

DTVR:- T3 DORBE NTLIT,N, 358,78 ROWOTIE0T B0éd02) DOTWT 358, AOTWeIE VAT
BVORB3 9G350 NOTB, 203, 93V, L0 AT 0T, eI, 30T FaOIND;

(&) ATRAON T RRBEN IPNY T2IS ADTO3 ABTOT ROPT B LINY ) 2,003 3N 3
DI, ). IVEFTWITT) WsENPINT T, 923 TOTT) 20T MeedRE), ear3edo &E3,00TC), 95350 ABTOT
RAOPT  ToXWEIFTBOD B33 JIITDo0R0RITST) 9B 20T BSSNED,
ROWORATIET) 95330 2,08 83,3, 0D, €9 RDRITeIT) e3NTI®,1);

() £923F T38TE). 353.0350N3es 3)8A8e20,08R D3I), RETTITINTE 3R ABTIT
ROFT BTION GBI LT, 3 35308 9BE R o IVBIH, B

() OREASLODT DD LNRWTBITOEOT HO,FT, A ATI®H,ED, DB, AVTIT AOFTNY
2303 2303 [RET, 9350 SINENDR 233 2338 33730, DO AIR20TITR.

(23) 3 OBDIDRDT BODE), ABTT RO N WDRIES BROTHE R LI, BRODTII
ABTDOD ROWIERE), 905 JDRIEIODD, 9B RDRIE H0T IBFTIDAD AeITs ALIOD
RR3EP A 9Bead Br3aD), AT3T,T,.

XX XX XX
17. RB=;3.8 oR3Br3.- (1) G3odt a358.080,-

(D) IO DEPADNOTD TIODVECH JBOILN 9 FTRITRORT T 90 IS,
DY ONT T; 980

() CoxdOD A JIATE OTTIGTNTE OFeT0 33387 OGFRITE OTTFT),N 37,
ARDRO L), 0T 3T 0H HRJE IVONFODZINCDBTF €atgad O LORVTIEEY) BeNAO,RBDRJ3,
23, 907 T, BN FoDEDIOT 6063 BIRENY 9538 NIATDTT;

(A) €0 ABWTOT AOTeY) SLRITOT RO 3530, SBRISBT ;
(&) €383 2010 83583309 Te30, L3RS TES ABTIT AOFT, TN IR ;[NE3
- 98330 ATR ;RN W3S VWO HBE TN I T,



(8) 16:3¢ TWBTEAT BODE), FWR3,, BRODEN 9TBE TN DET;

(DT®) ROPT 9T 93T, TVEITOA TINAIES 23950 F V0TS ROWY BWLBOIS
B RLNCDNG.J; 95830

- 933 ATA 50N &jelT BB ITBE N3, T,

(2) ATRs, (DX NBTTOHRE), IDFR BRRIE OIBEINYD), O0e)TEBROTT,
WPREBT, OIBE T DVROTROT €933 AWR 500NTEHT FRINBOTB0T) 230608 3T, T0.

(2) BB DI, DODDNY IGFaTD BV IDNY NN RBRsooN B, B3NP,
JTe3DAE), F3ZeN DRD) JRENY PO IJPOJITT, O3 @O 93D  a3Nmen
R 5TNTIRY T DO IDTALN 3T,T30.

XX XX XX

20. BWR;0 5DI3NeD.- (1) ABTT F0FT OB, AR, O3 &3 DB 9 e C0aI3C
QA3AENOD FOFT TR 950 NOBLOD IWAT 2DTEBODE), 2,038,083 B, sDIaI,
BRODIIH, e

(2) & FPTOR S5BNY, Toa) AWR50NTE ABTOT ROFPT e0ToRLS 90 eNOBPAD
ATRC DTRHBADNE), eDJ2FIVANIL) BT, BRODTIB,EL), DOTT:

() T 03 AR 9T ADDIE ATA;

(e3-1) 230 BTOTTOE 2020, RN 5;

(ed-ii) 1653 2ByTTERT3 (1) BT TOERTI (B3), (), (d5F), DI, (28) LOTWNY 23R ADARPOT
2B ROCTNCIS AL3A0;

(-ii]) 0T RPN DI0TF, 9% THVIHN 3023 8elN BI,VRY S0NY ¥ FoPT
xwx?gmw 2020, a?g‘@‘.;

TB03, T POBB) TeITH B0 Ee, e9BT BALOBBOE IB2e700H 3T SBE 0T
ROPT BT AFEIBRT 7230DE). eiona3d R RO {RBRsIN P 9:3,030e307 3B, T3€)..

(d-iv) TFT 800D BTOREINY Byd eDRTD) RDTRINDN HeXTINED IR &8 2uld, A3Rs, ),
3D e3T550 2020, DO3AEN.

(D-v) &RTY NT0I3TC IWTOT RBRENFRVNR NTeIPRTS)., IDFR, SRAWTITIEOIZ 903
FIR, ASNPI, 950 APOZINP, WPATRTEN 3,13 2020, AR 95330 3.

B0, (d-iv) TNR (V) NBDOBRFA TR IWROBNY 0TI, ©OT IWRTD
BT BRENY 9TRNR FTFAWRT A2l 95809 :NOBLAD IRV LHT0RBODNE), 20T 23N RII
BT, 0, BRODTIT,TL,.

©) (i) 0303 FTBTOT FOPW RSN TW,NEN3RE OFeTo BYRF, S DI
313¢ T TS FTN DT 9DTIDOADD, SCeddRTRNTTO3RE;

(i) O3 FBTOV B0 e) 123¢ BBTHTS TN 33 BesonzdcTo ) e3c3ed= esoNBodseC;

(iii) O3 ABTOT ROy 3, TOONER, DYT0A I 9Tl II, ToONE I,
) A 3RE;

(iv) O30 ROPBW Jpos WEEZey) A0 aDI)  DNONERR, @S i3 LIR30,
TBRODTBA3RE,-

(@) 90T ROBTE). DFLTZRRE ABTOD [RFTB BDTOR T/ A0 A0 BOWHEERS), ROFH

3retdad &¢e3 FTR £0:33,8,03 TR B3RP AT,L), 3T

(2D) BEDTORD LTI 2IV50D), FTEF NV, RyBTLOT,NIEDIN BRI, OINY e030233z30N
e30350 ROROD IMESCH 23 HIB 0330 LNE BRR 9T BIROODVE FRIE B3RI,




10

YRINT), BT BeFR,L BT, B3I IFOOEE), 90T FOFF, TN Xe3/eHTo3TBOD
BAR,, DT D), DINY TRFE ). SoCEIT B3B3,

(v) vt VBD0RBTBE), 3 LD FoFL T V3T L3088 F0FDNTBA3E
- &3 O Tt IBTOT RO

IBVB.- F0FT AT, AIOTOTTN €953, €353 BOZ,E DINDR BRI X231
F0WORAT BRI, TR, 3T2eT003 sHTeRLIOR 953630 RedS0D AIR;T 2HTEIHBOD DJ0TF,
FAR, 20RFZ), OHINDR 00w FOFF, 3,083 23FMITIT ABHTK NCD LRBRTTY, OIS
B 3D ST €3 LIV BLTOTIOTI) 2T0ed BIT,LI.

XX XX XX
22. XXX
276, B30, BI0H ), ILIT8) TSR, )TN .- SBT3 FOFT T3 AR, RTIR5D,-
() 2oOD 80T TOAF T NTIRZING g8 2RV eNTIRINPNR BoTIMES sNRT;

() NTBIDNYD), IDFR, TRIWTDTOEO3 FOFeY NWIWOF TIOR, AN, €900
RPOZ NP, &W3TRE 2IPATRIES sDRDOTF,

RO B AeBIONE), o308, 88,00,

B0 2020, AWRRD FAR, ALBNY, 2FABRED D BT 9500 FIR, F0B;0D IeIndnt
ToTONEN IA WS, €8, DRT) JIRENY  oJ[PADIIR &H3 XK@BF 33, DI,
FYBRY,IT,RD,.

XX XX XX

28. DR Hwe IP.- (1) IDBTT IOPW D3R, BRI IRDODWD),  IFHR
ETRIOD, FEARDTIT D), 0T ROV, DBAY,,CAOTS 95330 2,073 ADER, ToONE
FOODTR,  SBROY 2px]2 W, ABRT R0 WL 2.0TITRY,, arteleln
QORDRWTITOBRY,  B3oedt3 IWR008 ON3  FRDTADI, ALFTVAT 3Feod  2.08H
3one$n FBOHIT,N.

(2) (1)3¢ waBRFTeTe), el fNAT BTN 90ATeIdN FBTOT FOPE IFR 30T
RBAHT), FCHDTI, DT, T 95T 9B[I0T Tr 2R, e9PF,3TE CBt 353,030 o
FZZODT, TV IPTIT BRODTI T, DBy, 3 IIADD, Fed)3A0TW FEADLRT A3 DO
270edRIZT,T 20D, €3 T3 FOFPT NTIPNY TN T0AET 0T F2F0DNE), SBRWTBITTTI €Y,
B35BTV, I), DR,,T) SRR BADFONE). IFHHEeTON SeDADIT V3T B5ITOCRF I,
SBRED DTOT BRODTI™,T.

XX XX XX

29%. RdD3od RNWIR;B P, oIBFINSD.- (1) et [dodn BRPHI IBTT IO
Re30D FTR;VON 2RDVRCIIBINED, 95379 SLeNTRL TN L9T3EI0 30I0T0EDARE,-

() 2DEBCIPN 3,08 RN TIE WIVTHEX 20INY F0WOBEE), 93 €3 RO
953609 BIT O30T RTBTOT RO T, AIAICNG T;

-9TE VNI,
XX XX XX
(8) RBTT BOFT Fedd 30D 0303 BLHs~ 9533 L9DTOT e9z3HODE), -

() &8 (1), (2) DR, BX  ABZFORRS),  IDFRBRAT  O3e)at
OIDVEINLRRVIET; 90

(D) e9a3D, B DICNENT ACVEINY P T0 RFWTT ROFT NRIDNY LVEFOTRL,
VORI WVRCRDOT VG0 FPLIE JOFFDOT 9T aD0%WRTISAD eINZedTedN, ABTIT
ROFT RedI3OD sD02RTIS BT BP0 ABTC IOPEW 9G30 BT RedI3AD Deadnednt



11

AT TN €9GeI0 IWBFIT ROFE IR 2I0GTRMB03 Oe)c3t DEICHE), BIFABT a0
RIERITT; 95339

() 95330 DT03TeIN T LIDICNTNT DCDEDNY L9T3e30 VTeIPNY 2T BRTLR DT
AT INY 95800 STBNRY DT 530N B3FATT 9530 336 A3 TT; 98339

(@) 933 3, TISNPI, F)DTTedN De3F oI DTT, D8R, 0 IR 2008
WO BN 90 TP O3B FWAsST, ITHITW EDROT RCNTITOTIED DI, S8
NTSTBFTTRT (), (), (3) DB, (B) DOTWNF), TP LIRADNY 207, 905 STBT), IDER,,
VRRLLBIVTO3 08D [RENPR LINCTWOT R[POPRTVR ABTT ROFE AoHT SBT3,
BROBHOIB BTN, ITBENRRPRWTIT):

TB0D), G303 ITT, B9 3THT T, B0BeINTO3RE €3 35871 9B, BRPBRT,L) IWPT,
£953T03 AT BRTVD 1 B0 FTTEATI TR 0303 e3T3¢FeI, BB IT,WEY,.

XX XX XX

29, Red30h W0 BB, ewodserhad esBA 2 2300 o SR, PIr3rITH).-
AB/T0 ROFT FeNI0D IWAT VRIS, 8T, TP, 3850e00R30edT 9530 93T T3ROS
eV0E3THES CIVYHTE 2306) TS, 90T BOFT VT IRDNF), ADE R, FTRRITTITOG DCICHE),
B 3E RBIT,LD.

T30, ITBTID HDET 303N +NOBWOCH NPT TLTHAZW 9T s> €933HOD
368,03 Bed, VRT, OB INEITT TTTAS O30T ) A9,Ndd, 233F 30BN
RVRBAAN, SBRIT,,:

&3), TT03B), OB WPRTE TSRO BT DR 9THOD 9FF3,03 ThD
[BTIE), O30S WINET ITRON BOOFTEL03 A5y WODBPATBONE T3 [NER ABRT RByd
VNI TS ORI eNROT eNOBAANAS 239D Ao, a3, s30T 3 3E 3T0TBITITN.

3[R B0, e5TA,T DTICD SN, DTIAIVE AT0TR0W &) Jondevnen
SEPI HOBP AN 02N JTEeIVRE), 0T DT, X, Se3ndd, JWOTTT) PeedIREIIE e0DROT
3003TTD,-

XX XX XX

39D0. IVTD WhHrTo3™me e303¢MN.- (1) Totss ITOE T, ATOFD Tozss BITE), L9DRLIIOD
DROT, 2,2, FBTD 2DV L30INT, eI, 220, TIONEWAEORNT, WFRROBTES 2,083 BT
T3 e3aetneah, 33x3T,:0,.

(2) TosTBAR ABTOT BOPNPYN SWANE DTY, DVIRBRT, SBRII D3I, 33,00003
&035T3 WE3 N, I0JDRIT TIONFE LIDLFN, ATEIN DB, DADOI)E0s)) BTV LDV
TYPTOT D 330N3 3B,

XX XX XX

3980. oIV JoWoDAWOo3 JWCOD FIF 3B ewooFFIned.- (1) T TFTWD
€93, ODadaTHad AT 530300 ANT, TTERIN T I, TOD TIEI5T PV0FICTMS O0eHc3
FOODEW 9P SRBT 3D, BR,TNET, RN OBOE  DLaFONOW a3k 80H ST
BRTICNNFIBTNA A DRIV 2TV AIOT WOTLCHIN IB,T.

XX XX XX

(4) S8 TTTOrasy) IN,0NTMNE WsENFOWT, DEIIEFOTT SALRT NP, 9AR,083° DEIFOrT
3RO, R,BOTT SRR, FAEOTF BALRT T D), TORIESI BINY A LT00F,
9FeT0  HUENIEERDTCAD  HOZRRBRADRTE, OFPW0  HTRBANE),  DINT, oD
RRBPTT, OB 9T SRRPBF, I0WODABOZ IRt FIrWdmDy STRCOAEN
JeeDBRA0ETIE 0Bt BIT [sy; 0D, BXCD FIFRs" N0 TWORPADD, S ITIT
NBLBNPMEN ITNATeTON IGKERITULD, STT 9D & 9PIAENT eDRDT 5500 28N
93,50 DRV FIF DNV, WwFRRORTIH,TEY..



12

XX XX XX

68. DRI, ,0R €323¢3.- (1) DBAY,,0, ABTOT A0F P HBT BLRPHTIONFI, 643¢
TyTTeOT [DATNS I2FITHBONE), €T30 65:3¢ 20, 652) FBVHE sDBNS SBDAEOHTIODE), BOTIIOT
SN BNF T, FOBBREN eI, FEINFRD, BOBOA) ATXEDRIT 3T T3, el 3 STIBE),
ADER BRIVTTVEOT T, ©ORTE). ILAT  RDABAYR  ZFRAWZO3 € DheeT
NIARFESTAL Al

XX XX XX

72. A®Te0 XoRNY IJshoIS.- (1) DBRY,,B, 643 JFTLT 3N JeFOTHB STBATS
953200 633 ZyTTEDT LIBONE), 3B, BTOFRCET SWAT 955230 65:3¢ FyBTLaT a3 BDICOR 35083
3T 9T ABTOT AOPT ABAS0 By d V0,3 3R 2301 3,03 TLHAIQ TR, B REATD
A AT 930N, ALTDAR 230¢e3, €3 B3, BB IRLPRLHTOT 92)HYCNTBIRE),, 9533
TR, AROBINIAPRLNFTORE IBEIRED 33EFS, ITVTONR 3T, adTeIOD), VB
93BT, BT B30 BRTLR2ITBIT.

(2) DRA,,03) Foo N3l -

(@) BORT RBRT 30835030 2,083 ABTT IOFHE SACOBBR 9N B5e)Te3 TIR, ROBsNOB
BTN ONTIIE) ; €930

() ARV ROPR) TOONERTY, DYTORADR), 90 ToORE R, O AR ;
9e0 930 JSREOWRBOH DTVOTRE €38) JoNWHNRLRFR el 33 JONPHNRPR oo dI,
c:)@j\)d‘)a@m;

() [RLOBB DI, Bs[AABS 2N, T IDADIDDOT €9FeT0 eIIT TNEBT DDA
R NPI, TDRITHTI, FBTOT RBOTIe) O ATITIE),
- RBWTOT BOFBN, AeIRBTINRPRITOZ ATCEDRI STTT, 2300 C32TIT.

{3) AB/TT AOPT 33 OWIXTDRDIH,HOT DBAR,, 0 e9)T0dSE,03
O3e)TE ROTILIETE), ATHTIE FTOT, €3 FOFT AR I 3T T, £9e3:3) BT BRIDTR).

(4) B TyTOR), DI R0, DREE Ws0TS ODI FPRE eD0LRTIICDI, BWBE
BRTBD), CITEHEK ABTOT 2LIV;0TR, RERPVBIRAPRIT,EBL), G0 ReEINRPAIE 3THTS30,
B, RRPIID,Te)..

(5) B IBTIWE), DX 2WwFRROBT VL, DBFY,,T, FOTW Ty AONC), A0,
30D, F0RTIE TR WBERNIR)Y, ATV TowDRY,, eNITIVS 3098, BRTBAT NI EPaAD
DROT, & ROPII, RNOITINAPAINET, OGP0 FRPOBTWT, IRBTT ROFPR[I0,
REBIRR PRI TN 3T F[I, WRBIT,R,.

XX XX XX

Xord WRTHOD, DTIRRG Feiw, Londe, &7, wRe , JAND 500, 233¢ IewF 2021



3

TP
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FIFTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
NINTH SESSION
(Adjourned Meeting)

THE KARNATAKA CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2021
(LA Bill No. 22 of 2021)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Co-operative Societies Act, 1959,

Whereas, it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Co-operative Societies Act,
1959 (Karnataka Act No.11 of 1959) for the purpose hereinafter appearing.

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the seventy second year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the Karnataka
Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.- In the Karnataka Co-operative Societies Act, 1959
(Karnataka Act No.11 of 1959) hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 2, for
clause (e-1-a) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(e-1-a) “Delegate” means a Director of a Co-operative Society appointed by the
Board to represent that Co-operative society in other Co-operative Society with power to
participate and vote in the general meeting and to contest or propose or second in the
election of the Co-operative society to which he is appointed as delegate.”

3. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),-
(i) for clause (b) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(b) Where all the applicants are individuals, the number of applicants shall not be
less than twenty and the applicants shall not belong to the same family; and

(ii) after clause (b) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(b~1) where all the applicants are cooperative societies, the number of applicants
shall not be less than thirteen.

Provided that State Government may in special cases permit the applicants co-
operative societies less than thirteen.”

4. Amendment of section 17.- In section 17 of the principal Act,-
(1) in sub-section(1), for clause (f} the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“f) is a paid employee of the society or its financing bank or its union or its federal
society.”



2
(1i) for sub-section (2-A), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2-A) If any person is found to be a member or continuing as member in two or more
co-operative societies carrying similar business, it shall be obligatory on his part to retain
membership in any one society of his choice within a period of ninety days from the date of
commencement of the Karnataka Co-operative Societies (Amendment) Act, 2021. If he fails
to do so, his membership shall be deemed to have been ceased in the Co-operative society
to which he is newly admitted.”

5. Amendment of section 20.- In section 20 of the principal Act in sub-section (2),-
(i) in clause (a-iii) for the proviso the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“Provided that nothing in this clause shall apply to member of a society participating
in the first General Body Meeting and the first election of the Board of such society held
immediately after its registration.”

(11) for clause (a-iv) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(a-iv) a member, a representative or a delegate who has failed to attend at
least any two annual general meeting out of the last five annual general
meetings duly communicated to him;”

(iii)  for clause (a-v}) except the proviso, the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“(a-v) a member or a representative who has failed to utilize such minimum
services or facilities as may be specified in the Bye-Laws for any two Co-
operative years out of the last five Co-operative years;”

(iv) in proviso to clause (a-v) for the words “three years” the words “one year”
shall be substituted; and

v) in clause (b) in explanation for the words “fifteen days” and “thirty days” the
words  “twenty one days” and “forty five days” shall respectively be
substituted.

6. Insertion of new section 22.- After section 21 of the principal Act, the following
shall be inserted, namely:-

“22. Restrictions on holding shares.- In any cooperative society, no member
other than the Government, or any other cooperative society with the previous sanction of
the state Government, the State Warechousing Corporation or Zilla Panchayath constituted
under the Karnataka Gram Swaraj and Panchayat Raj Act, 1993 (Karnataka Act No 14 of
1993) or any statutory or non-statutory board, committee or corporation shall hold more
than such portion of the total share capital of the society not exceeding five percent thereof
as may be prescribed.”

7. Amendment of section 27A.-In section 27A of the principal Act,-
(i) in clause (a) for the word “three” the word “two” shall be substituted;

(1) in clause (b) after the words “specified in the byelaws” the words “for any two
co-operative years out of the last five co-operative years” shall be inserted; and



3

(iiij in the proviso for the words “three years” the words “one year” shall be
substituted.

8. Amendment of section 28.-In section 28 of the principal Act, after sub-
section (2) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

“(3) The quorum for the special general meeting shall be the same as specified
in sub-section (4) of section 27.”

9. Amendment of section 29C.- In section 29C of the principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1), in clause (a) after the words “co operative society” the
words “or Souhardha co-operative” shall be inserted;

(i) in sub-section (8), in clause (d) for the words “in cases falling under clauses
(a), (b}, (c) and (d) of this sub-section” the words “in cases falling under
clauses (a), (b), (c) and (d) of this sub-section remove and” shall be
substituted.
10. Amendment of section 29E,- In section 29E of the principal Act, after the
first proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-
“provided further that the board may fill up casual vacancy of the board by
nomination out of the same class of members in respect of which the casual vacancy has
arisen till the election is held for such vacancy.”

11. Amendment of section 39AA.- In section 39AA of the Principal Act, in sub-
section (2), for the words “electoral rolls for” the words “electoral rolls and conduct of” shall
be substituted.

12. Amendment of section 39I.- In section 391! of the principal Act,

(1) in sub-section (4) after the words “this section applies are” the words
“the election officers” shall be inserted; and

(ii) after the words “in connection with the” the words “preparation of
electoral roll or” shall be inserted.

13. Amendment of section 68.- In section 68 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(1);-
(ij for the words “The Registrar may” the words “The Registrar shall” shall be
substituted; and

(ii) after the word “disclosed” the words “in the audit report under section 63 or” shall
be inserted.

14. Amendment of section 72.- In section 72 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(5) the following shall be inserted, namely;-

“(6) The process of winding up of a co-operative society under sub-sections (1), (2)
and (5) above, shall be completed within a period of three years from the date of direction
from the Registrar:

Provided that the said period may be extended by the Registrar for the reasons to be
recorded in writing for a further period of one year:

Provided further that the State Government may, on a report made by the Registrar
shall have power to extend the said period, if it is satisfied that, there are genuine grounds
for the extension.”



4

15. Insertion of section 128-A.- After section 128 of the Principal Act, the following
shall be inserted, namely;-

“128-A. Constitution of a Common Cadre (1) Notwithstanding anything contained
in this Act, the rules or the bye-laws made there under, where the Registrar in the interest
of the co-operative movement, considers that creation of common cadre of employees in
primary Agriculture credit Co-operative Society which is substantially financed by the
Government or if it is carrying on substantial Government scheme or business of state or
central Government or its undertaking (herein after referred to as affiliated society) is
necessary, he shall authorize District Central Co-operative Bank to which such class of co-
operative societies is affiliated to exercise the power of appointment, transfer and
disciplinary action in respect of chief executive of that co-operative societies as may be
specified by him and make such regulations as may be necessary for carrying out the said
purpose. Where such Federal Cooperative Bank is so authorized by the Registrar, the
affiliated cooperative societies shall not have powers to deal with such categories of
employees except to the extent the regulation may permit.

(2) The Registrar shall have power to require the affiliated agricultural Cooperative
Credit societies to make contribution of such sum every year towards expenditure as the
District Central Cooperative Bank is likely to incur or has incurred for the purpose. If any
co-operative society fails to pay the said sum to such authority as may be specified by the
Registrar and within the time fixed by him the Registrar may on the application of the
authority and after such enquiry as he may consider necessary, make an order requiring
the affiliated co-operative society to pay the amount and every such order shall be
enforceable against the co-operative society as if it were an award under section 71.”

16. Substitution of expression Co-operation Election Authority.- In the principal
Act, for the words “Cooperative Election Commission” wherever they occur, the words
“Cooperative Election Authority” shall be substituted.



3

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Co-operative Societies Act, 1959
(Karnataka Act No.11 of 1959) to,-

(a) omit some contradictory provisions regarding voting rights and membership
in section 17 (2A), section 20 (2)(a-v) and proviso to section 27A;

(b) address the issues challenged in the writ petitions filed before Hon’ble High
Court of Karnataka challenging section 20 (2) (a-iv) and (a-v);

(c) inculcate true spirit of democracy in attending general body meetings and
utilization of minimum services of cooperative society and active participation
of members in the management of co-operative societies; and

(d) implement the suggestions made by the Reserve Bank of India to complete the
liquidation process of co-operative bank/societies in time schedule.

Certain consequential amendments are also made to provide clarity.

Hence, the Bill.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed legislative measure.



7

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 6: Empowers the State Government to make rules regarding such portion of
the share capital not exceeding five percent of the total share capital of
the society which can be held by a member.

The proposed delegation of legislative power is normal in character.

S.T. SOMASHEKAR
Minister for Co-Operation

M.K. VISHALAKSHI
Secretary (I/c)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly




8

ANNEXTURE
EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA CO-OPERATIVE SOCIETIES ACT, 1959

(KARNATAKA ACT 11 OF 1959)

XX XX XX

2. Definitions:-In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,-

XX XX XX

{e-1-a) delegate means a member of the board of a Co-operative society appointed by the

board to represent that Co-operative Society in other co-operative societies.
XX XX XX

6. Application for registration of co-operative societies.- (1) An application for the
registration of a co-operative society shall be made to the Registrar in such form and after complying
with such formalities as may be prescribed; and the applicants shall furnish to him all such
information about the society as he may require. .

(2) Every such application shall conform to the following requirements, namely:—

(a) the application shall be accompanied by five copies of the proposed bye-laws of the co-
operative society;

(b) where all the applicants are individuals, the number of applicants shall not be less than
ten;

(c) every one of the applicants who is an individual shall be above the age of eighteen years
and the applicants shall not be members of the same family;

Explanation.—For the purpose of this clause family in relation t o a person means an
individual, wife or husband, as the case may be, and their dependent children and parents;

(d) where the objects of the co-operative society include the creation of funds to be lent to its
members and where all the applicants are individuals, the applicants shall reside in the same village
or town or in the proposed area of operation of the co-operative society or belong t o the same class
or pursue the same occupation;

(e) the application shall be signed by every one of the applicants who is an individual and by
a person duly authorized on behalf of any co-operative society which is an applicant.

(f) the application shall be accompanied by such fee as may be prescribed and different fees
may be prescribed for different class or classes of co-operative societies.

(g) in the case of the ¢ o-operative which intends to convert itself into a Co-operative Society
under this Act, the application shall be accompanied by a resolution of the general meeting of such
Co-operative approving such conversion

XX XX XX

17. Disqualification for membership.- (1) No person shall be eligible for admission as a
member of a co-operative society, if he,-

{a) has applied to be adjudicated an insolvent or is an undischarged insolvent; or



9

(b) has been sentenced for any offence, other than an offence of a political character or an
offence not involving moral turpitude, such sentence not having been reversed or the offence
pardoned and a period of five years has not elapsed from date of expiry of the sentence.

(c) carries on business of the kind carried on by such co-operative society;

(d) is already a member of a ¢ o-operative society carrying on business of the same kind as
itself;

(e) is not eligible for membership under section 16;

(f) is a paid employee of the society or of its financing bank; or

{2} If a member becomes subject to any of the disqualifications specified in subsection (1), he
shall be deemed to have ceased to be a member from the date when the disqualification was
incurred.

(2A) If a member fails to fulfill his obligations as a member under the Act, rules or bye-laws,
for a continuous period of three years, he shall, on the expiry of such period, cease to be a member.

XX XX XX

20. Votes of members.- (1) No member, no representative or no delegate of a society shall
have more than one vote in the general meeting or in the election of the members of the board of the
co-operative society.

{(2) The following shall not have the right to vote at a general meeting or an election of the
members of the board of the co-operative society in which they are members, namely:—

(a) a nominal or associate member;
(a-i) an individual member who is a defaulter;

(a-ii) members admitted as per clauses (d), (e), () and (g) of sub-section (1) of section 16, who
are defaulters;

(a-iii) a person who has become member of a society not later than twelve months prior to the
date of such meeting or election

Provided that nothing in this clause shall apply to a person of a society participating in the
first general body meeting of such society held immediately after its registration;

(a-iv) a member, a representative or a delegate who has failed to attend three general meetings
out of the last five general meetings;

(a-v} a member or a representative who has failed to utilize such minimum services or facilities
in a co-operative year as may be specified in the byelaws for three consecutive cooperative years.

Provided that in case of members in sub-clauses (a-iv] and (a-v}, such members shall not have
the right to vote at a general meeting or an election of members of the board for a period of three
years.

(b) a co-operative society,—
{i) the board of which stands superseded or to which a special officer is appointed under
section 31 of the Act;

(ii) which is ordered to be wound up under section 72;

(iii) which has not commenced working or has ceased to work;



10

(iv) whose principal object is to advance loans and whose percentage of recovery is, -

{a) less than fifty percent of its total demand for the Co-operative year immediately preceding
the Co-operative year during which the meeting or election is held or;

(b) which fails to pass on to the financing bank or the credit agency, as the case may be, fifty
percent of the demand or the entire portion of the recovered amount of the demand of the financing
bank or credit agency, whichever is higher, at least fifteen days before the date of the general
meeting or the date of election, after a notice of not less than thirty days in this regard has been
issued to that society

(v} other than the society referred t o in sub-clause (iv), which is a defaulter;

Explanation.—A member shall be deemed to be a defaulter if he has failed to pay the arrears
of any kind due by him to the society as borrower, or has failed to pay any other amount due by him
to the society at least fifteen days before the date of the general meeting or the date of election of the
members of the board after a notice of not less than thirty days in this behalf has been issued to
him.

22. XX x
XX XX XX

27A Participation of members in the management.- Every member of a cooperative society
shall participate in the management of the society,-

(a) by attending three out of the last five annual general meetings;

(b) by utilizing every year such minimum services or facilities offered by the society as may be
specified in the byelaws.

Provided that if a member fails to utilize the minimum services or fails to attend the
minimum meetings, he shall lose his right to vote, for a period of three years.

XX XX XX

28. Special general meeting.- (1) The board of a co-operative society may, at any time, call a
special general meeting of the society and shall call such meeting within one month after the receipt
of a requisition in writing from the Registrar or from one fifth of the total number of members to
transact a specified business.

(2) If a special general meeting of a co-operative society is not called in accordance with the
requisition referred to in sub-section (1), the Registrar or any person authorized by him in this
behalf, shall have the power to call such meeting and that meeting shall be deemed to be a meeting
called by the board and shall have power to transact all business which can be transacted at the
annual general meeting under the bye-laws of the society and such other business as is specially
mentioned in the requisition made by the Registrar.

XX XX XX

29C. Disqualification for membership of the board.- {1) No person shall be eligible for
being elected or appointed or continued as a member of the board of any co-operative society, if,-

(@) he is in default to that society or any other co-operative society in respect of any dues
from him as borrower;

XX XX XX



11

(8) If any member of a board of a co-operative society during the term of his office,-

(a) becomes subject to any disqualifications specified in sub-sections (1), (2) and (5); or

(b) has acted or has been acting fraudulently or with gross negligence or in contravention of
the provisions of this Act, the rules or the bye-laws of the co-operative society or without the
sanction of the board of the co-operative society where such sanction is necessary or contrary to the
resolution of the co-operative society or its board or in any way prejudicial to the interest of the co-
operative society; or

(c) has acted or has been acting persistently against the directions or orders issued under

this Act, rules or bye-laws; or

(d) is not discharging his duties satisfactorily; the Registrar may either on a report made to
him or otherwise, by order remove such member, and in cases falling under clauses (a), (b), (c) and
(d) of this sub-section disqualify him from holding any office in the co-operative society for such
period not exceeding five years, as may be specified in such order:

Provided that no order shall be made under this sub-section unless a reasonable opportunity
of being heard, is given to the person against whom the order is to be made.

XX XX XX

29E. Filling up of casual vacancy in the office of members of the board.- Any vacancy in
the office of members of the board of a co-operative society by reason of death, resignation, removal
or otherwise, shall be filled up in such manner as may be specified in the bye-laws of such society.

Provided that the cooperative election commission shall conduct the election to fill up any
vacancy in the office of the director of the board if the remaining term of office of the board is more
than half of its original term.

Provided further that the board may fill up a casual vacancy on the board by nomination out
of the same class of members in respect of which the casual vacancy has arisen, if the remaining
term of office of the board is less than half of its original term

Provided also that, if the board fails to fill up such casual vacancy within three months of the
date of occurrence, the Registrar shall fill up through nomination

XX XX XX

39AA Co-operative Election Commission.- (1)The St at e Government shall, by notification in
the Official Gazette, constitute a Cooperative Election Commission consisting of a cooperative
election commissioner and a secretary.

(2) The superintendence, direction and control of the preparation of the electoral rolls for all
elections to the Co-operative Societies in the Stat e shall be vested with the Co-operative Election
Authority.

XX XX XX

391. Breaches of official duty in connection with election.- If any person to whom this
section applies is without reasonable cause guilty of any act or omission in breach of his official
duty, he shall, on conviction be punished with fine which may extend to five hundred rupees.

XX XX XX

(4) The persons to whom this section applies are the returning officers, assistant returning
officers, presiding officers, polling officers and any other person appointed to perform any duty in
connection with the receipt of nomination or withdrawal of candidature or the recording or counting
of votes at an election and the expression “official duty” shall for the purpose of this section be
construed accordingly, but shall not include duties imposed otherwise than by or under this Act.



12

XX XX XX

68. Order by the Registrar.- (1) The Registrar may make an order directing the co-operative
society or its office bearers to take such action as may be specified in the order within the time
mentioned therein to rectify the defects and remedy the irregularities disclosed in the inquiry under
section 64 or inspection under section 65 and 65B.

XX XX XX

72. Winding up of co-operative societies.- (1) If the Registrar after an audit has been
conducted under section 63 or an inquiry has been held under section 64 or an inspection has been
made under section 65 or on receipt of an application made by not less than three-fourths of the
members of a co-operative society, is of opinion that the society ought to be wound up, he may, after
giving the society an opportunity of making its representation, issue an order directing it to be
wound up.

(2) The Registrar may, of his own motion, make an order directing the winding up of a
cooperative society,—

(a) where the number of members of the society has been reduced to less than the minimum
number required for registration of the co-operative society; or

(b) where the co-operative society has not commenced working 2 [within a period of six
months of the date of its registration or has ceased to function for six months or

(c) where the co-operative society has ceased to comply with the conditions imposed by or
under this Act regarding registration and management.

(3) The Registrar may cancel an order for the winding up of a co-operative society, at any
time, in any case where, in his opinion, the society should continue to exist.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section, no co-operative bank shail be wound
up or an order for winding up shall be cancelled except with the previous sanction in writing of the
Reserve Bank.

(5) Notwithstanding anything in this section, the Registrar shall make an order for the
winding up of a cooperative society, if the general body of the society, by a resolution passed by two
thirds majority of the members present and voting in a general meeting decides for the winding up of
that society

XX XX XX

Govt. Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaluru, 234 March, 2021, P7, W.D. , Copies 500



